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Urban partnership on culture and cultural heritage 

Horizon 2020 project Description 

CLIC Circular models Leveraging Investments 
in Cultural heritage adaptive reuse 

 

The CLIC Taskforce on Circular models for 
cultural heritage adaptive reuse in cities and 
regions enlarges the project scope to a wider 
community of innovators in cultural heritage 
and the CLIC Startup Competition supports 
and awards the best business ideas and 
startups in the field of cultural heritage 
adaptive reuse inspired to the circular 
economy principles. 
 

Open Heritage organizing, promoting and 
enabling heritage re-use through inclusion, 
technology, access, governance and 
empowerment 

Mapping of current heritage re-use policies 
and regulations in Europe 
 

 

Urban partnership on public spaces 

Horizon 2020 project Description 

Open Heritage organizing, promoting and 
enabling heritage re-use through inclusion, 
technology, access, governance and 
empowerment 

Observatory Cases Report on Managing the 
Urban Common  
 

 

Urban partnership on air quality 

Horizon 2020 project Description 

iScape improving the smart control of air 
pollution in Europe 

Findings on green infrastructure have been 
already exploited and incorporated in the 
Guidelines for green infrastructure used for 
London City. 
Guidance for city stakeholders and decision 
makers including policy briefs is available here  
 

CLAiR-City citizen-led air pollution reduction 
in cities 

Developed and tested an innovative and 
systematic citizen and stakeholder 
engagement process including a serious game 
and app for local air pollution policy. 
Comprehensive policy packages were 
produced for each city and policy briefs for 
Amsterdam, Aveiro, Bristol, Ljubljana, Liguria 
and Sosnowiec 

https://cordis.europa.eu/project/id/776758
https://www.clicproject.eu/taskforce/
https://www.clicproject.eu/taskforce/
https://www.clicproject.eu/startup-competition/
https://cordis.europa.eu/project/id/776766
https://cordis.europa.eu/project/id/776766
https://openheritage.eu/wp-content/uploads/2020/01/D2.2_Observatory_Cases_Report.pdf
https://openheritage.eu/wp-content/uploads/2020/01/D2.2_Observatory_Cases_Report.pdf
https://cordis.europa.eu/project/id/689954
https://www.iscapeproject.eu/implementing-green-infrastructure-for-air-pollution-abatement-general-reccomendations-for-management-and-plant-species-selection/
https://www.iscapeproject.eu/results/
https://cordis.europa.eu/project/id/689289
http://www.claircity.eu/2020/03/19/citizen-engagement-tools-and-techniques/
http://www.claircity.eu/2020/03/19/citizen-engagement-tools-and-techniques/
http://www.claircity.eu/2020/03/19/citizen-engagement-tools-and-techniques/
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Urban partnership on climate adaptation 

Horizon 2020 project Description 

Climate-fit.city pan-European urban climate 
services 

Translated scientific urban climate data into 
relevant information for public and private 
end-users in cities demonstrating the benefits 
of urban climate in topics: climate and health, 
building energy, emergency planning, urban 
planning, active mobility, and cultural 
heritage and tourist management   
 

CLARITY integrated climate adaptation service 
tools  for improving resilience measure 
efficiency 

The project produced a screening tool that 
can support urban and regional decision-
makers identify climate-change related risks 
and relevant adaptation options for 
investment projects. Screening is possible for 
more than 400 European cities. 

 

RESIN climate resilient cities and 
infrastructures 

The project produced tools to support cities in 
designing and implementing climate 
adaptation strategies for their local context  
 

 

Urban partnership on nature-based solutions 

Name of publication Link 

Nature-based solutions for microclimate 
regulation and air quality 

Analysis of EU-funded projects 

Nature-based solutions towards sustainable 
communities 

Analysis of EU-funded projects 

Nature-based solutions for climate mitigation Analysis of EU-funded projects 

Nature-based solutions for flood mitigation 
and coastal resilience 

Analysis of EU-funded projects 

Nature-based solutions improving water 
quality and waterbody conditions 

Analysis of EU-funded projects 

Biodiversity and nature-based solutions Analysis of EU-funded projects 

 

 

 

https://cordis.europa.eu/project/id/730004
https://project.climate-fit.city/sectoral-services/
https://cordis.europa.eu/project/id/730355
https://csis.myclimateservice.eu/
https://cordis.europa.eu/project/id/653522
https://resin-cities.eu/resources/
https://op.europa.eu/en/publication-detail/-/publication/001a9517-d530-11ea-adf7-01aa75ed71a1/language-en/format-PDF/source-166796734
https://op.europa.eu/en/publication-detail/-/publication/9afec646-cbc7-11ea-adf7-01aa75ed71a1/language-en/format-PDF/source-search
https://op.europa.eu/en/publication-detail/-/publication/6dd4d571-cafe-11ea-adf7-01aa75ed71a1/language-en/format-PDF/source-166796734
https://op.europa.eu/en/publication-detail/-/publication/d6e80dca-d530-11ea-adf7-01aa75ed71a1/language-en/format-PDF/source-search
https://op.europa.eu/en/publication-detail/-/publication/d6efaeeb-d530-11ea-adf7-01aa75ed71a1/language-en/format-PDF/source-166798349
https://op.europa.eu/en/publication-detail/-/publication/d7e8f4d4-c577-11ea-b3a4-01aa75ed71a1/language-en/format-PDF/source-166798349

